
Jodi Pierce

From: Director Cathcart

Sent: Tuesday, February 13, 2018 3:40 PM

To: Jodi Pierce

Cc: Director Cathcart

Subject: Fwd: Washroom Quote

Attachments: ATTOOOOI.htm; Quotation Golden Rodeo Grounds Washroom.doc; ATT00002.htm

HiJodi

Here is a quote from Absolutely Hammered in Golden for the washroom upgrade for the Light Horse Club

Karen

Karen Cathcart

CSRD Area "A" Director

Cell 250-344-8357

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Ron and Nancy Watson" <diamondr@telus.net>

Date: February 10, 2018 at 11:40:54 AM MST
To: "Director Cathcart" <KCathcart@csrd.bc.ca>

Subject: FW: Washroom Quote

From; Greg McTaggart [mailto:gmandjm(a)telus.net]
Sent: Monday, February 5, 2018 8:17 AM
To: diamondr@itelus.net

Subject: Washroom Quote

Hi Ron
See attached. Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thanx

Greg



ABSOLUTELY HAMMERED
CONTRACTING INC.

Box 1197 (250) 344-0644 OR
GOLDEN, BC VGA 1 HO GMANDJM@TELUS.NET

QUOTATION

FOR: DATE: FEB 5/2018
GOLDEN RODEO GROUNDS
ATTN: RON WATSON
PH. 344-3208

QUOTATION: GOLDEN RODEO GROUNDS WASHROOM BUDGET PRICE

INCLUDES:
REUSE EXISTING FOUNDATION
DEMO EXISTING WOOD STRUCTURE
ADD 4X7 FEET SIDE ADDITION WATER ROOM
VANDAL PROOF BLOCK STRUCTURE, STEEL DOORS, TRUSS/METAL ROOF
ELECTRICAL AND PLUMBING
INTERIOR FINISHES WITH VANITIES AND STALLS
HANDICAP ACCESSIBLE

OUR PRICE $ 100,000.00

NOT INCLUDED:

GST
CLEAN OUT WORK AREAS
SEPTIC FIELD
NEW WATER LINE FROM PUMP HOUSE

NOTE: PRICING IS BUDGET NUMBERS ONLY AND BASED OFF WASHROOMS AT THE
GOLDEN SOCCER FIELDS

THANK YOU
GREG MCTAGGART

THIS QUOTE IS VALID FOR 30 DAYS PAYMENT DUE 30 DAYS UPON INVOICE DATE
WITHOUT PREJUDICE, ALL RIGHTS RESERVED


